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WORLDWIDE FACILITIES, LLC 
 Goes Live with I-Engineering’s ALIS Enterprise System 

A Next Level Agency Management System Launched by an Elite Wholesaler in CA 
      

Shelton, CT, June 21, 2016 – I-Engineering, Inc. is pleased to announce the launch of the All Lines Insurance Suite 
(ALIS) Enterprise System with Worldwide Facilities, LLC, a national wholesale brokerage and managing general 
agent with a 5-Star MGA Rating.  ALIS is the next generation Agency Management System, providing a fully 
integrated Rating Engine with Web Services, Policy Issuance and Management, Renewals, Endorsements, 
Cancellations, Reinstatements, Claims, Workflow, Document Management and Reporting, as well as a full 
Accounting module.  ALIS streamlines the entire insurance cycle. This system can be interfaced with third party 
systems via API or XML transfer.  

Ron Austin, President of Worldwide Facilities, commented, “ALIS Enterprise System is designed to provide flexible 
programming capabilities to serve our organization as we add new products and services to our offerings. This 
programming flexibility gives us the opportunity to serve our business partners in a more efficient and effective 
manner. ALIS helps in daily management activities with its powerful reporting capabilities and effective 
maintenance of agents and carriers. Our agents and brokers can offer a broader range of solutions to their 
customers in a shorter period of time.”      

Cameron Kelly, CFO of Worldwide Facilities explains, “We selected I-Engineering due to their knowledge and 
commitment to the industry. I-Engineering has developed certain functions which are significant enhancements for 
wholesale brokerage operations, such as an increased level of Integration with Outlook, a more efficient method of 
Merging and Importing Documents, Batch Processing for Submissions and Renewals, Follow-ups tied to 
Correspondence, as well as other efficiencies. The features such as Dynamic Quote Designing and an Interactive 
Income Statement are powerful business tools. I-Engineering implemented replication for the entire system to 
facilitate accurate data representation between multiple offices and make it easy to maintain with cost 
effectiveness.  They work with us and our carriers to streamline web services integration and automate policy 
issuance processes.  Their solution assimilates with our carriers in a unique method which only enhances our 
business.” 

Naval Kapoor, President and CEO of I-Engineering says, “We began a strong working relationship with Worldwide 
Facilities with the concept of designing and creating an entirely new wholesaler system, having all necessary 
binding and brokerage operations for achieving greater efficiency.  Worldwide Facilities contributed to our 
knowledge of the insurance industry and we have been able to produce for them ALIS, an all in one Agency 
Management System, having capability of doing both binding and brokerage business with extreme efficiencies and 
automations of many processes.” 

Kapoor continues, “We are proud to have worked with Worldwide Facilities in providing them with this state of the 
art technology to make their operations more efficient. With the use of this cutting edge system and our dedicated 
team of professionals, I-Engineering, Inc. is bringing the insurance industry to heights previously unimaginable. We 
were honored to have the opportunity in working with Worldwide Facilities to develop and implement this 
innovative program.” 
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About Worldwide Facilities, LLC 

Formed in 1970, Worldwide Facilities is a leading private and independent wholesale broker and managing general 
agent offering its products and services through offices throughout the United States.  

About I-Engineering, Inc. 

For over fifteen years, I-Engineering has worked with MGAs/Wholesalers/Program Administrators, and Carriers to 
implement customized P&C insurance software solutions that enhance productivity and speed to market. Our 
product offering includes an all-encompassing Agency Management System, Policy Management System for 
London, Program Administration System and customized Comparators for Commercial & Personal lines.  

I-Engineering, located in Shelton, CT, develops and markets Integrated Insurance Solutions to provide MGAs and 
wholesalers with a modern, technologically friendly working environment. We have created and implemented a 
sophisticated collection of cutting edge insurance software solutions catering to Wholesale Brokers, MGAs, 
Program Managers and Carriers.  I-Engineering’s ALIS Enterprise System – an all-in-one solution – provides Rating 
with web services, Quoting, Policy Issuance and Management, Workflow and Document Management and Full 
Accounting.  A sophisticated agent portal is integrated with ALIS to allow producers to get quotes on a real time 
bases. This fully integrated system provides MGAs and Wholesalers end-to-end solutions.  

I-Engineering is also a proud member of many P&C Insurance organizations including  
Target Markets, NAPSLO, AAMGA, CIWA. 

 

  

 

For more information contact: 
 
Angela Cross 
Asst. Marketing Manager  
I-Engineering, Inc.  
a.cross@i-engineering.com 
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